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LAURENTIAN BANK’S ANNUAL QUÉBEC CITY GOLF TOURNAMENT RAISES 
$15,000 IN AID OF THE CARREFOUR DES ENFANTS DE SAINT-MALO 

Montréal, June 27, 2011 – Laurentian Bank is proud to announce that the annual edition of its 
golf tournament in Québec City at the Club de golf Cap-Rouge was successful in raising 
$15,000 for the Carrefour des enfants de Saint-Malo. This organization works to combat socio-
affective poverty by offering disadvantaged children aged 4-12 a place to come together, be 
heard and enjoy a sense of belonging. 

“Once again this year, we had the opportunity to welcome more than 150 clients, business 
contacts and employees for an enjoyable day on the links,” underlined Luc Bernard, the Bank’s 
Executive Vice-President of Retail and SME Financial Services. “At the same time, participants 
had the chance to show their support for an organization that is really making a difference and is 
recognized for the value and excellence of its interventions. This event is perfectly aligned with 
Laurentian Bank’s commitment to assisting organizations within the communities in which it 
operates.” 
 
About Laurentian Bank 
 
Laurentian Bank of Canada is a banking institution operating across Canada and offering its 
clients diversified financial services. Distinguishing itself through excellence in service, as well 
as through its simplicity and proximity, the Bank serves individual consumers and small and 
medium-sized businesses. The Bank also offers its products to a wide network of independent 
financial intermediaries through B2B Trust, as well as full-service brokerage solutions through 
Laurentian Bank Securities.  
 
Laurentian Bank is well established in the Province of Quebec, operating the third-largest retail 
branch network. Elsewhere throughout Canada, it operates in specific market segments where it 
holds an enviable position. Laurentian Bank of Canada has more than $23 billion in balance 
sheet assets and more than $15 billion in assets under administration. Founded in 1846, the 
Bank employs more than 3,700 people.  
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